
The Ultimate Guide: Raising, Housing,
Breeding, and Caring for Nigerian Dwarf
Goats

Gentle, small, and full of personality, Nigerian Dwarf Goats have captured the
hearts of many farmers, hobbyists, and pet lovers around the world. This versatile
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breed of goats is not only known for their adorable appearance but also for their
excellent milk production, making them ideal farm animals for small-scale dairy
operations or as cherished pets.

The Basics of Nigerian Dwarf Goats

Originating from West Africa, Nigerian Dwarf Goats were introduced to the United
States in the early 20th century. They are a mini breed, reaching an average
height of 17-19 inches at the shoulder and weighing around 75-100 pounds.
These goats come in a variety of colors and patterns, adding to their charm.
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Despite their small size, Nigerian Dwarf Goats are highly adaptable and intelligent
animals. They are friendly, social, and enjoy interacting with humans, making
them perfect companions for children. With proper care and attention, these
goats can live for 12-14 years.
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If you're considering raising Nigerian Dwarf Goats, there are several essential
factors to consider:

1. Housing Requirements

Providing suitable housing is crucial to ensure the health and well-being of your
Nigerian Dwarf Goats. They need a secure and dry shelter that protects them
from extreme weather conditions, predators, and offers enough space for resting,
feeding, and playing. Implement a proper ventilation system to reduce the risk of
respiratory diseases.

2. Feeding and Nutrition

High-quality hay, along with a balanced diet consisting of grains, minerals, and
access to clean water, is essential for Nigerian Dwarf Goats' overall health.
Feeding them adequate fiber promotes good digestion and prevents
gastrointestinal issues. Consult with a veterinarian to determine the specific
dietary needs of your goats.

3. Healthcare and Preventive Measures

Regular veterinary check-ups, vaccinations, and deworming are essential to
ensure the long-term well-being of your Nigerian Dwarf Goats. Establish a
vaccination and deworming schedule based on your vet's recommendations.
Additionally, keep their living environment clean and practice good sanitation
habits to prevent diseases.

Breeding Nigerian Dwarf Goats

Breeding Nigerian Dwarf Goats requires careful planning and understanding of
their reproductive behavior. Here are some key points to keep in mind:

1. Selecting Breeding Stock



When selecting breeding stock, assess their conformation, genetics, health
history, and ask for proof of breed registration. Choose goats that complement
each other and have desirable traits such as excellent milk production, strong
conformation, and friendly temperament.

2. Mating and Gestation

Nigerian Dwarf Goats are seasonal breeders, typically mating during the fall
season. Ensure proper buck-to-doe ratio and observe the signs of heat in does
for successful breeding. The gestation period for Nigerian Dwarf Goats lasts
around 145-155 days.

3. Kidding and Kid Care

Assist the doe during the kidding process if necessary, and provide a clean and
safe area for both the doe and her kids. Ensure adequate colostrum intake for the
kids within the first few hours of birth to strengthen their immune system. Monitor
their growth, provide proper nutrition, and make sure they receive vaccinations
and preventive treatments.

Caring for Nigerian Dwarf Goats

Proper care and attention are integral to maintaining the happiness and well-
being of Nigerian Dwarf Goats:

1. Exercise and Enrichment

Allow Nigerian Dwarf Goats to roam freely in a secured pasture where they can
exercise, graze, and explore. Providing structures such as ramps, platforms, and
toys can keep them mentally stimulated and prevent boredom.

2. Grooming



Regular grooming involves trimming hooves, checking for parasites, cleaning
their ears, and brushing their coats. This routine not only enhances their
appearance but also helps identify any potential health issues early on.

3. Social Interaction

Nigerian Dwarf Goats are highly sociable creatures and thrive when they have
companionship. Consider having a small herd rather than a solitary goat, as they
experience a sense of security and camaraderie in a group.

Overall, raising, housing, breeding, and caring for Nigerian Dwarf Goats can be a
rewarding and enjoyable experience. While it requires dedication and
commitment, the bond formed with these charming animals and the benefits they
provide make it all worthwhile.

Sources: Purdue University Extension, National Pygmy Goat Association
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Nigerian dwarf goat farming is popular and common throughout the world. The
breed is found and popular around the world and it is a multi-purpose dwarf goat
breed.

It is very good for meat production and also good for milk production. Actually the
Nigerian dwarf goat is considered as the best miniature dairy goat breed.

Along with good milk and meat production abilities, the Nigerian dwarf goats are
also very good for raising as pets. Compared to the body size of the Nigerian
dwarf goats, they are highly milk productive than the regular sized breeds.

They are excellent as pets, mainly because of their easy maintenance and small
stature. Commercial Nigerian dwarf goat farming is also popular in some
countries, because these goats are excellent for both meat and milk production.

Read on to know more on to raise the perfect Nigerian dwarf goat as a pet
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