
Master the Art of Acting In Restoration
Comedy with the Applause Acting Series!
Are you an aspiring actor looking to dive into the world of restoration comedy?
Look no further than the Applause Acting Series - your ultimate guide to
mastering the art of acting in restoration comedy. In this comprehensive article,
we will explore the essence of restoration comedy and how you can excel in this
unique genre.

What is Restoration Comedy?

Restoration comedy refers to the comedic plays staged in England during the late
17th century, particularly during the Restoration period (1660-1710). This period
marked the reopening of the theaters after a 18-year-long ban during the Puritan
rule.

Restoration comedy is known for its witty language, bawdy humor, and satirical
portrayal of social norms and aristocratic society. The plays often revolve around
themes of love, marriage, infidelity, and the clash of classes.
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The Elements of Restoration Comedy

Restoration comedy is characterized by its distinctive elements:

1. Wit and Wordplay:

Restoration comedy is brimming with clever wordplay, puns, repartee, and
innuendos. The actors must have a strong command of language and impeccable
timing to effectively deliver the humor.

2. Stock Characters:

The plays often feature stock characters such as the fop, the witty servant, and
the cunning seductress. Each character has specific traits and behaviors which
actors need to embody convincingly.

3. Intricate Plots:

The plots of restoration comedy are usually complex with mistaken identities,
secret affairs, and elaborate schemes. Actors must navigate through the twists
and turns while maintaining the comedic charm.

4. Physical Comedy:

Physical comedy plays a significant role in restoration comedy, with exaggerated
gestures, slapstick humor, and comedic mishaps adding to the laughter. Actors
must possess the ability to execute physical comedy with precision.

How to Excel in Acting In Restoration Comedy

Mastering the art of acting in restoration comedy requires a combination of skill,
knowledge, and practice. Here are some tips to help you excel in this unique
genre:

1. Understanding the Language:



Restoration comedy relies heavily on the use of eloquent language and witty
dialogue. Familiarize yourself with the style, vocabulary, and phrases commonly
used during this era. Practice enunciation and master the rhythm of the language.

2. Developing Comedic Timing:

Timing is everything in restoration comedy. Work on your comedic timing by
rehearsing with fellow actors, experimenting with different comedic techniques,
and observing performances of experienced restoration comedy actors.

3. Studying the Characters:

Delve deep into the characters you will be portraying. Understand their
motivations, quirks, and relationships in order to bring them to life on stage. Pay
attention to the physicality and mannerisms associated with each character.

4. Embracing Physical Comedy:

Physical comedy is an essential component of restoration comedy. Practice
physical movements, gestures, and comedic falls to enhance your performance.
Study the techniques of physical comedy masters and incorporate them into your
own style.

5. Embodying the Spirit of the Era:

Immerse yourself in the world of restoration comedy by studying the culture,
fashion, and societal expectations of the time. Gain a thorough understanding of
the social dynamics and class distinctions prevalent during the Restoration
period.

Applause Acting Series: Your Path to Success

If you're serious about pursuing a career in restoration comedy, the Applause
Acting Series is your ultimate resource. Designed specifically for actors aspiring



to excel in this genre, the series provides in-depth training, practical advice, and
valuable insights into the world of restoration comedy.

The Applause Acting Series offers a wide range of resources including:

1. Step-by-Step Guides:

From analyzing scripts and understanding the genre to developing character arcs
and perfecting comedic timing, the Applause Acting Series provides step-by-step
guides that take you through every aspect of acting in restoration comedy.

2. Expert Interviews:

Gain valuable insights from renowned restoration comedy actors and directors
through exclusive interviews. Learn from their experiences, techniques, and tips
for success in this unique genre.

3. Practical Exercises:

Put theory into practice with interactive exercises designed to enhance your skills
in comedic timing, physical comedy, and character development. These exercises
are specifically tailored to the requirements of restoration comedy acting.

4. Script Analysis Tools:

Get access to tools and resources for dissecting restoration comedy scripts.
Learn how to identify comedic elements, decipher bawdy humor, and bring out
the essence of the characters.

5. Community Support:

Connect with fellow actors, share experiences, and seek guidance from a vibrant
community of restoration comedy enthusiasts. Collaborate on projects, exchange
feedback, and stay updated with the latest trends in the industry.



The Applause Acting Series is your comprehensive guide to mastering the art of
acting in restoration comedy.

Acting in restoration comedy requires a unique set of skills and a deep
understanding of the genre. By immersing yourself in the world of restoration
comedy, studying the elements that define this genre, and harnessing the
resources provided by the Applause Acting Series, you can excel in this
captivating genre of theater.

So, if you're ready to embark on a journey filled with witty wordplay, exaggerated
characters, and hilarious mishaps, join the Applause Acting Series today and let
your talent shine on the restoration comedy stage!
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The art of acting in restoration comedy, the buoyant, often bowdy romps which
celebrated the reopening of the English theatres after Cromwell's dour reign, is
the subject of Simon Callow's bold investigation. There is cause again to
celebrate as Callow, one of Britain's foremost actors, aims to restore the form to
all its original voluptuous vigor. Callow shows the way to attain clarity and hilarity
in some of the most delightful roles ever conceived for the theatre.
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