
35 Ways To Play Darts Brooke
Are you a fan of darts and looking for new and exciting ways to play? Look no
further! In this article, we will explore 35 unique ways to play darts that will take
your darting experience to a whole new level. Whether you are a beginner or a
seasoned pro, these game variations will surely add more fun and challenge to
your matches.

1. Around the Clock

This classic game is perfect for beginners. Start by throwing your darts at the
numbers 1 to 20 in order, aiming to hit each number with as few throws as
possible.

2. Cricket

Cricket is a popular game that tests your accuracy and strategy. The goal is to
"close out" numbers 15 through 20 and the bullseye by hitting them three times
before your opponent does.
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3. Killer

Killer is a competitive game that requires both precision and strategy. Each player
aims to hit certain targeted numbers to accumulate points, while avoiding the
"killer number" that can eliminate them from the game.

4. Shanghai

This challenging game requires players to hit specific sections of the board in a
predetermined order. For example, you may start with the single segment, then
move on to doubles and triples, aiming for the highest score possible.

5. Round the Clock

In Round the Clock, players take turns throwing a dart at the corresponding
number on the board. The goal is to hit each number in order, starting from 1 and
ending with 20.

6. Halve-It

Halve-It is a game of precision and control. Each player throws three darts at
each number from 1 to 20. The players' scores are then added up, but if a player
fails to hit a number, their score will be halved.

7. Overkill

In this fast-paced game, players aim to hit numbers from 1 to 20. The catch is
that each hit must be higher than the previous one. If a player fails to hit a higher
number, their turn ends.

8. 501

501 is a popular game in professional darts. Each player starts with a score of
501 and aims to reach zero by subtracting their score with each throw. The final



dart must land in a double or the bullseye to win.

9. Around the World

Showcase your darting skills in this challenging game where players aim to hit
segments on the board in order. Start with number 1, then move around the
board until you reach 20.

10. Baseball

In this baseball-inspired game, players aim to score runs by hitting specific
segments on the board. Each player takes turns throwing three darts, and the
player with the most runs wins.

11. Half it High Score

Challenge yourself by hitting certain numbers and aiming for the highest possible
score. If you miss, your score will be halved.

12. Shanghai Doubles

Play Shanghai as a doubles game for added excitement. Team up with a partner
and aim to hit sections of the board in the specified order. The highest combined
score wins the game.

13. Killer Round the Clock

Combine the competitive elements of Killer and Round the Clock by aiming to hit
certain numbers in order. Beware of the killer number that can eliminate you from
the game.

14. Knockout



In this elimination-style game, players take turns trying to hit specific segments on
the board. If a player fails to hit the designated area, they are knocked out of the
game.

15. Tic Tac Toe

Put a twist on the classic game by playing it with darts. The goal is to get three in
a row diagonally, horizontally, or vertically on the board, while your opponent tries
to block you.

16. Round the World

Spend a darting evening traveling the world with Round the World. Players aim to
hit each country on the board in order, starting from A and ending with Z.

17. Cricket Cutthroat

Test your skills in this cutthroat version of cricket. Each player aims to close out
numbers while also trying to keep their opponents from scoring by hitting their
numbers.

18. Count Up

In Count Up, players take turns throwing darts and attempt to accumulate the
highest score possible by hitting various segments on the board.

19. Follow the Leader

In this game, players take turns throwing darts and aim to hit the same segment
as their opponent. If successful, they stay in the game; otherwise, they are
eliminated.

20. Shanghai Triples



Aim for triple the fun by playing Shanghai with triples instead. Hit specific
segments on the board in the designated order.

21. Baseball Shanghai

Combine the scoring system of baseball with the challenge of Shanghai. Players
aim to score runs by hitting specific segments on the board in the determined
order.

22. 301

Similar to 501, players start with a score of 301 and aim to reach zero by
subtracting their score with each throw. The final dart must land in a double or the
bullseye to win.

23. Round the World Doubles

Team up with a partner for an exciting game of Round the World. Each player
must hit their assigned letter and move on to the next country on the board.

24. Forty One-Eighty

This game is all about hitting maximum scores. Players aim to hit as many 180s
as possible within a given timeframe or number of darts thrown.

25. Scottish Singles

Scottish Singles is a traditional dart game where players aim to hit numbers 1 to
20 in order. The player with the highest score at the end wins the match.

26. Legs

In Legs, players compete to win a certain number of legs, usually best out of
three or five. Each leg represents a set number of points, and the first player to



reach that point wins.

27. Around the Clock Doubles

Add some friendly competition to Around the Clock by playing in doubles. Each
player must hit their assigned number before moving on to the next.

28. Cricket Doubles

Team up with a friend for a thrilling game of Cricket. Work together to close out
numbers and block your opponents' scoring opportunities.

29. Knobbly Knees

Have fun and test your accuracy with this challenging game. Each player takes
turns throwing darts at their opponent's knees, aiming to hit as close to the knee
as possible without touching it.

30. Poker Darts

Bring elements of poker into darts with this exciting game. Each player must hit
segments on the board to build the highest possible hand.

31. Horse

Similar to the basketball game, players aim to spell out the word "HORSE." Take
turns setting a challenge shot, and if your opponent fails to replicate it, they earn
a letter.

32. Killer Bulls

This variation of Killer adds a twist by focusing on the bullseye. Players aim to hit
the bullseye three times, while avoiding being killed by their opponents.

33, Bob's 27



In Bob's 27, players aim to hit numbers 1 to 9 three times each, totaling 27 hits.
The player who accomplishes this first wins the game.

34. Stack Up

This challenging game requires players to stack darts on top of each other,
aiming to hit the same number with all three darts. The higher the stack, the more
points earned.

35. High Score Shuffle

End your darting session with a fun and competitive game of High Score Shuffle.
Each player aims to score the highest points possible, with the winner taking it all.

These 35 ways to play darts Brooke offer a wide range of game variations,
ensuring that you and your friends will never get bored of darts. From classic
games to unique twists, there is something for players of all skill levels and
preferences. So gather your darts and challenge yourself to try each of these
exciting game variations. Let the darting adventure begin!
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Dart is the game to play if you want to put your eye-hand coordination and
dexterity to the test. The game is played in different styles, each with
accompanying rules and varying levels of difficulty. This comprehensive guide is
created to not only give potential dart player’s the basic knowledge of Dart, but it
is also designed to introduce beginning and intermittent dart players to 35
different dart games, the rules governing these games and the scoring pattern. 35
ways to play Dart will introduce anyone to the joys of the game of Dart.
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