
10 Keys To Successful Professional
Development Language And Literacy Series

Professional development plays a crucial role in enhancing educators' skills and
knowledge. When it comes to language and literacy education, successful
professional development is even more vital as it directly impacts students'
language acquisition and literacy development. In this article, we will explore the
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10 keys to successful professional development in the language and literacy
series.

1. Clear Goals and Objectives

Professional development sessions must have clear goals and objectives that
participants can work towards. These goals should be specific, measurable,
achievable, relevant, and time-bound (SMART) to ensure that educators can
track their progress and gauge the effectiveness of the training.
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2. Expert Facilitators

Professional development sessions should be facilitated by experts in the field of
language and literacy education. These facilitators should have extensive
knowledge and experience, ensuring that they can deliver high-quality training
sessions and provide valuable insights to the participants.
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3. Engaging and Interactive Activities

Successful professional development incorporates engaging and interactive
activities that allow participants to actively participate and apply their learning.
These activities can include discussions, group work, role-plays, and hands-on
practice, ensuring that educators gain practical skills that they can implement in
their classrooms.

4. Customization to Individual Needs

Professional development sessions should take into account the diverse needs
and experiences of the participants. Customizing the content and approach
based on individual needs ensures that educators feel empowered and can apply
their learning in their specific teaching contexts.

5. Ongoing Support and Follow-up

Successful professional development doesn't end with the completion of a single
training session. Providing ongoing support and follow-up is essential to ensure
that educators can continue their professional growth. This can be done through
mentoring programs, online resources, and regular check-ins to address any
challenges or questions.

6. Collaboration and Networking Opportunities

Professional development should provide opportunities for educators to
collaborate and network with their peers. This allows them to share ideas, learn
from each other's experiences, and build a strong professional network that can
support their ongoing development.

7. Evidence-Based Practices



Professional development should be based on evidence-based practices that
have been proven effective in language and literacy education. By incorporating
research-backed strategies and approaches, educators can feel confident in their
abilities and know that they are using methods that have a positive impact on
student learning.

8. Integration of Technology

In the digital age, the integration of technology in professional development is
crucial. Providing educators with opportunities to explore and incorporate
technology tools and resources enhances their instructional practices and
enables them to effectively address the diverse needs of learners in today's
classrooms.

9. Assessment of Impact

It is essential to assess the impact of professional development on educators'
practice and student outcomes. Regular evaluations and feedback allow
educators to reflect on their progress and make necessary adjustments.
Additionally, assessing the impact helps organizations identify areas for
improvement and refine their future professional development offerings.

10. Sustainability and Long-Term Planning

Successful professional development requires long-term planning and
sustainability. It is crucial to ensure that resources, support, and opportunities for
growth are available continuously. By prioritizing sustainability, educators can
engage in ongoing learning, continuously enhancing their language and literacy
instruction.

, successful professional development in language and literacy education
involves having clear goals, expert facilitators, engaging activities, customization,



ongoing support, collaboration, evidence-based practices, technology integration,
impact assessments, and long-term planning. By focusing on these 10 keys,
educators can enhance their skills, improve student outcomes, and foster a love
for language and literacy among learners.
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Literacy Leadership in Changing Schools will help literacy leaders improve
teachers’ professional development in grades K–6. The authors use literacy
basics to suggest concrete approaches that leaders and coaches can use to help
teachers improve their instruction with culturally and linguistically diverse
students. Based on firsthand experiences, research, and a school-university-
community collaborative (Changing Suburbs Institute in New York),this practical
book homes in on what literacy leaders need to do in today’s rapidly changing
schools. With vignettes, strategies, and guidelines, each chapter is devoted to
one essential component of serving as an effective literacy leader. Throughout,
the book addresses typical issues leaders and teachers face, such as high-stakes
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testing, increasing failure rates, rigorous teacher and principal evaluations, family
engagement, shrinking resources, and teachers’ inexperience with instructing
diverse students.

“Today’s educators are faced with the challenge of meeting the increased
expectations associated with a high quality education for all children. The
contributors provide an excellent resource of relevant information along with a
wealth of concrete suggestions for meeting that challenge through effective
leadership and ongoing, embedded professional development. The result is a
road map for enriched learning experiences for the professionals involved and
ultimately for the students they teach.”
—Dorothy S. Strickland, Samuel DeWitt Proctor Professor of Education Emerita,
Rutgers

“This book encourages and supports leaders as they create bold, thoughtful and
empowering pathways for professional development. It is a recipe that has the
power to highlight the joy of professional growth and learning for leaders,
teachers and students alike. To me, that is truly fabulous.”
—Jennifer Scoggin, Director of LitLife, Connecticut

“The authors address important aspects of the decision-making process, namely
how to really know someone or something well before making a choice. Too
many of our educational choices are based on outdated or misinformation and
this book clearly shows school leaders how to obtain accurate information when
creating a cohesive literacy model. This book also takes complex aspects of
literacy professional development, such as standards and instructional
techniques and breaks them down in clear and applicable ways so that decisions
can not just be made but also be implemented.”
—Gravity Goldberg, Literacy Consultant, Director, Gravity Goldberg LLC
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